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MIAMI – (October 30, 2014) – Florida East Coast Realty (FECR) Chairman & President Tibor Hollo, owner 
of Colonnade Plaza (1201 Brickell Avenue), has announced that CVS/pharmacy has opened a new location 
in the company’s eight-story office building in the heart of Brickell. CVS/pharmacy, the nation’s leading retail 
pharmacy, occupies over 10,000 square feet on the ground floor of the building with the entrance located 
directly on Brickell Avenue.

“We are pleased to welcome CVS/pharmacy to Colonnade Plaza. Our office tenants and residents at Brickell 
Bay Plaza, the 643-unit condominium directly connected to the office building, will be extremely pleased to 
have such convenient access to the retail pharmacy. It is a fantastic addition to our building and to the Brickell 
neighborhood as a whole,” says Hollo.

The new CVS/pharmacy offers a full-service pharmacy, including immunizations seven days a week with no 
appointment needed; high quality health, beauty, and personal care products; private label products that come 
with a 100% money back guarantee; digital photo processing and gifts; and the CVS/pharmacy ExtraCare 
Program, the nation’s largest rewards program that provides customers money back, special savings, and 
offers that are earned by shopping in-store or online at www.cvs.com.
Colonnade Plaza boasts a “Roman-esque” style exterior architecture, with soaring structural columns. The 
elegantly-designed building features nine-foot, floor-to-ceiling windows, valet parking, 24-hour security, and 
desirable amenities. Located at the crossroads of Brickell Avenue and Coral Way, Colonnade Plaza offers a 
prestigious office address in the sought-after Brickell financial district.

About CVS/pharmacy
CVS/pharmacy, the retail division of CVS Health, is America’s leading retail pharmacy with more than 7,700 
locations. It is the first national pharmacy to end the sale of tobacco and the first pharmacy in the nation to 
receive the Community Pharmacy accreditation from URAC, the leading health care accreditation organization 
that establishes quality standards for the health care industry. CVS/pharmacy is reinventing pharmacy to help 
people on their path to better health by providing the most accessible and personalized expertise, both in its 
stores and online at CVS.com. General information about CVS/pharmacy and CVS Health is available at www.
cvshealth.com.


